
SHAREABLES

Chips + Salsa
Corn + Black Bean Salsa
Pretzel Sticks w/ Beer Cheese
Buffalo Chicken Dip
Jacked Mac n Cheese Bites
Spicy Corn Nuggets
Boneless Chicken Chunks

6.00
6.00

10.00
8.00

10.00
8.00

10.00

Pulled Pork Sandwich
Pulled Chicken Sandwich
Brisket Sandwich

11.00
11.00

13.00

Casual
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BUILD YOUR OWN PIZZA

START WITH OUR PIZZA SAUCE BASE AND MOZZARELLA CHEESE

THEN ADD YOUR CHOICE OF TOPPINGS

VENUE SPACE
DETAILS

We have two venue spaces in
the back of Sure Shot Tap
House. The Oakley Lounge
holds up to 40 people, while
the Butler Room holds up to
75 people. If your event
allows seating to be split, you
can rent out both spaces for a
larger party of up to 115
people. 

Rental fees for venue space if
using Sure Shot Catering:

Oakley Lounge - $50
Butler Room - $100
Both Spaces - $150

Rental fees for venue space if
not using Sure Shot Catering:

Oakley Lounge - $150
Butler Room - $300
Both Spaces - $450
 
Rental fees are non-
refundable.

A deposit in the amount of
the rental fee is required to
hold your space and date.
You will receive a receipt
confirming your booking.   

We offer table linens and
cloth napkins for an
additional fee to give your
event that formal touch.

Sales tax and a 15% gratuity
will be added to your bill
upon checkout on the day of
your event. If you wish to tip
more to your servers, you can
do so when prompted during
checkout. 

EVENT MENU

SANDWICHES

8 Inch
10 Inch Cauliflower
12 Inch
14 Inch
16 Inch

PIZZA SIZES
9.00
12.50
12.50
15.75
18.00

TOPPING CHOICES
Pepperoni
Sausage
Ham
Bacon
Beef
Chicken
Mushrooms
Onions

Green Pepper
Tomato
Banana Peppers
Green Olives
Black Olives
Jalapenos
Extra Cheese
Extra Sauce

ALL SANDWICHES COME WITH

CHIPS + A PICKLE SPEAR

SIDE ITEMS

Potato Chips
Baked Beans
Loaded Potato Salad
Macaroni and Cheese
House Slaw

1.25
2.75
2.75
2.75
2.75

SPECIALTY PIZZA

8 Inch
10 Inch Cauliflower
12 Inch
14 Inch
16 Inch

14.50
19.25
19.25

22.50
26.50

DELUXE, MEAT, VEGETABLE,

CHICKEN BACON RANCH


